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CORRIGENDUM No: 1 

to the 

CONTRACT NOTICE  

 

Publication Ref: EuropeAid/138526/IH/SER/GH 

 

Subject:  Technical Assistance to enhance Employment coordination function of the Ministry 
of Employment and Labour Relations (MELR) to ensure implementation of the National 
Employment Policy 

Location: GHANA 

The contract notice is corrected or modified as follow: 

Point n°: 7  

Instead of  

To enhance linkages and cooperation with relevant stakeholders notably in the areas of social 
protection, technical and vocational education and training (TCET) and business and 
cooperative development. In this regard, the TAT will assist the MELR staff in the activities 
foreseen with the aim to ensure the sharing of knowledge related to the implementation of the 
project. 

Read  

To enhance linkages and cooperation with relevant stakeholders notably in the areas of social 
protection, technical and vocational education and training (TVET) and business and 
cooperative development. In this regard, the TAT will assist the MELR staff in the activities 
foreseen with the aim to ensure the sharing of knowledge related to the implementation of the 
project. 

Point n°: 21.3 

Instead of  

The candidate has provided services successfully under at least two contracts each with a 
budget of at least that of this contract in fields related to the project such as employment, 
vocational training, public administration’s management, human resources management and 
development which were implemented at any moment during the reference period to this 
contract in the past three years. 

Read 

The candidate has provided services successfully under at least two contracts each with a 
budget of at least EUR 1 500 000 in fields related to the project such as employment, 
vocational training, public administration’s management, human resources management and 
development which were implemented at any moment during the reference period to this 
contract in the past three years. 

Ref. Ares(2017)1602788 - 24/03/2017



 

15 January 2016 – EuropeAid/138526/IH/SER/GH Page 1/1 
a5b_corrigcontractnotice_en.doc 

Point n°: 23 

Instead of  

21/04/2017 

Read 

03/05/2017 at 10:00 AM (Ghana time) 

All other terms and conditions of the contract notice remain unchanged. The above alterations 
and /or corrections to the contract notice are integral part of the contract notice. 
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